
Drawing and Collage Workshop
with Arts for Dementia

Join our FREE workshop for people with early-stage dementia or
mild cognitive impairment and their companions. 

Enjoy a fun creative activity
Make new social connections
Develop new skills 
Combat memory worries

Thursday 22nd May 2025
11:15am - 12:15pm

Vibast Community Centre, 
167 Old St, London
EC1V 9NH

When:

Where:

Contact: 

 info@islingtoncarershub.org

To celebrate Dementia Action
Week, we will be hosting a free
one-hour creative workshop at
Vibast Community Centre for you
to come and try out.

You are invited to take part in a
drawing workshop where you will
learn mark making and pattern
techniques with our Arts for
Dementia facilitator, Jasmine-
Karis. These drawings will end up
becoming your very own
personalised collage pieces, which
you can take home with you at the
end of the session.

No previous art experience is
needed. It's all about having fun
and giving it a go!

020 7281 3319 
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